
 
 
Vrbo Host Incentive Offer Terms & Conditions 
 
1. Offer.  This limited-time offer applies to users located in the United States who 

have not previously listed a property on Vrbo.  Only individual hosts are eligible; 
integrated property managers are excluded.  

 
2. Eligible Properties.  Eligible properties must be newly listed whole homes with at 

least two bedrooms, located in the United States (excluding Oahu, HI and Clark 
County, NV).  Previously deactivated/relisted properties, or listings managed by 
integrated property managers do not qualify.  Only your first eligible property is 
covered by this promotion. 

 
3. How to Qualify.  List your eligible property via the unique link provided by Vrbo as 

part of the offer.  Within 180 days of listing your eligible property, your listing must 
receive one or more completed bookings with an aggregate booking value of US 
$400 (including taxes and fees) for a 2-bedroom property, or US $500 (including 
taxes and fees) for a 3+ bedroom property.  Stays must be completed by the guest, 
paid for in full and not cancelled.  Multiple bookings may count toward the 
threshold.  

 
4. Promotional OneKeyCash.  Once the required aggregate booking value is reached, 

you will receive US $400 in promotional OneKeyCash (for a 2-bedroom listing) or US 
$500 in promotional OneKeyCash (for a 3+ bedroom listing).  The promotional 
OneKeyCash will be deposited into your Vrbo traveler account within 14 days after 
the qualifying bookings required aggregate booking value is reached. OneKeyCash 
is subject to the One Key Terms and Conditions and will expire in 18 months from 
the date of issuance if there has not been any eligible activity as set out in section 
4.4 of the One Key Terms and Conditions. OneKeyCash is not redeemable for cash 
and can only be used on Vrbo or other participating brands. This promotional 
OneKeyCash is limited to the intended recipient and is not transferable. Void where 
prohibited by law.   

 
5. Additional Terms.  This offer may not be combined with other Vrbo promotions or 

host incentives.  Eligible stays and promotional OneKeyCash are subject to 
verification and Vrbo’s discretion.  Participation means agreeing to Vrbo’s Host 
Terms of Service, Guest Terms of Service and Privacy Policy.  You are responsible for 
any tax obligations and compliance with all local laws, including those regarding 
short-term rentals.  Vrbo may modify, suspend, or cancel this offer at any time.  
Updates may be communicated via email or the Vrbo website, and continued 
participation indicates your acceptance of the revised terms.   

https://www.vrbo.com/one-key-terms

